NHS

East London
NHS Foundation Trust

Information Governance
Robert Dolan House

9 Alie Street

London

E1 8DE

Email elft.foi@nhs.net
Website: https://www.elft.nhs.uk

17 April 2024

Our reference: FOI DA5327

| am responding to your request for information received 8 April. This has been treated as a
request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.

| am now enclosing a response which is attached to the end of this letter. Please do not
hesitate to contact me on the contact details above if you have any further queries.

Yours sincerely,

Information Rights Coordinator

If you are dissatisfied with the Trust's response to your FOIA request then you should contact us and we will arrange for an
internal review of this decision.

If you remain dissatisfied with the decision following our response to your complaint, you may write to the Information
Commissioner for a decision under Section 50 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. The Information Commissioner can be
contacted at:

Information Commissioner’s Office
Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

Tel: 0303 123 1113
Web: www.ico.org.uk

Please note that the data supplied is not allowed to be re-used and/or published without the explicit consent of
East London NHS Foundation Trust. Please contact the signatory to request permission if this is your intention
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Request: With reference to above case, would you provide me with the following
information under FOIA 2000:

Question 1: Lists of doctors, nurses, MH workers, police and housing officers with
full names, positions Who [sic] and placements on both visits to my flat.

Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 1 of your request for information under the
Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.

Section 40 for the FOI Act states:

(2) This exemption covers the personal data of third parties (anyone other
than the requester) where complying with the request would breach any of the
principles in the UK GDPR.

In order for the Trust to provide the information requested, we would have to
access patient records as the information is not held in a searchable format.
We do not have a legal basis to access patient records for the purposes of
responding to a freedom of information request. The Trust is therefore unable
to provide a response. Should you wish to obtain copies of your own personal
data please contact elft.accesstorecords@nhs.net

Question 2:  Full names of doctors, police, and housing officers in charge of both
teams?

Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 2 of your request for information under the
Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.

Section 40 for the FOI Act states:

(2) This exemption covers the personal data of third parties (anyone other
than the requester) where complying with the request would breach any of the
principles in the UK GDPR.

In order for the Trust to provide the information requested, we would have to
access patient records as the information is not held in a searchable format.
We do not have a legal basis to access patient records for the purposes of
responding to a freedom of information request. The Trust is therefore unable
to provide a response.

Question 3: Copies of both warrants?

Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 3 of your request for information under the
Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.

Section 40 for the FOI Act states:

(2) This exemption covers the personal data of third parties (anyone other
than the requester) where complying with the request would breach any of the
principles in the UK GDPR.

In order for the Trust to provide the information requested, we would have to
access patient records as the information is not held in a searchable format.
We do not have a legal basis to access patient records for the purposes of
responding to a freedom of information request. The Trust is therefore unable
to provide a response.

Question 4. Copies of formal reports about both visits?

Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 4 of your request for information under the
Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.
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Section 40 for the FOI Act states:

(2) This exemption covers the personal data of third parties (anyone other
than the requester) where complying with the request would breach any of the
principles in the UK GDPR.

In order for the Trust to provide the information requested, we would have to
access patient records as the information is not held in a searchable format.
We do not have a legal basis to access patient records for the purposes of
responding to a freedom of information request. The Trust is therefore unable
to provide a response.

Question 5:  Who personally assembled and were in charge of both teams and their
actions?

Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 5 of your request for information under the
Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.

Section 40 for the FOI Act states:

(2) This exemption covers the personal data of third parties (anyone other
than the requester) where complying with the request would breach any of the
principles in the UK GDPR.

In order for the Trust to provide the information requested, we would have to
access patient records as the information is not held in a searchable format.
We do not have a legal basis to access patient records for the purposes of
responding to a freedom of information request. The Trust is therefore unable
to provide a response.

Question 6: Full name and position of the ELFT FOI officer with email address.

Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 6 of your request for information under the
Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled—
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information
of the description specified in the request, and

(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not employ an FOI officer as
requested and is therefore unable to provide a response.

Question 7: Full names and positions both in Homerton hospital and ELFT of the
former CEO.

Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 7 of your request for information under the
Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled—
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information
of the description specified in the request, and

(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not hold information on Homerton
hospital as requested and is therefore unable to provide a response. Please
contact them on huh-tr.foi@nhs.net.

The former CEO of East London NHS Foundation Trust was Paul Calaminus.
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Question 8: Date and reason for resignation of the former CEO.

Answer: The date of resignation for East London NHS Foundation Trust’s former CEO
was 20 August 2023 and the reason was because he was appointed as CEO
of North-East London NHS Foundation Trust.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not hold information on Homerton
hospital as requested and is therefore unable to provide a response. Please
contact them on huh-tr.foi@nhs.net.

Question 9: Where and in what capacity does she works now and how to contact her
for coming Tribunal hearings.

Answer: Paul Calaminus is now the CEO of North-East London NHS Foundation Trust.
Please contact the Trust directly at foi.foi@nelft.nhs.uk to obtain contact
details.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not hold information on Homerton
hospital’s CEO as requested and is therefore unable to provide a response.
Please contact them on huh-tr.foi@nhs.net.

Question 10: What is the date of the appointment of the interim CEO and the Chair.

Answer: The Interim CEO for East London NHS Foundation Trust was appointed 21
August 2023 and the Chair for East London NHS Foundation Trust appointed
on 1 January 2023.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not hold information on Homerton
hospital as requested and is therefore unable to provide a response. Please
contact them on huh-tr.foi@nhs.net.

Question 11: Were both visits to my flat directed and supervised by the former CEO or
Interim CEO?

Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 11 of your request for information under the
Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.

Section 40 for the FOI Act states:

(2) This exemption covers the personal data of third parties (anyone other
than the requester) where complying with the request would breach any of the
principles in the UK GDPR.

In order for the Trust to provide the information requested, we would have to
access patient records as the information is not held in a searchable format.
We do not have a legal basis to access patient records for the purposes of
responding to a freedom of information request. The Trust is therefore unable
to provide a response.
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