
Can you please provide an update on the following 4 questions regarding your Trust’s Infrastructure?

1. For each element of IT infrastructure below, please provide the requested details: Main provider Annual spend 2022-2023 Contract end date Additional notes

Desktop management Lenovo 31/01/2025

Networking Cisco 20/12/2024

Data Centre AWS 31/03/2027

Server management

The Trust has reviewed question 1 of your request for 

information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 

applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

Question 2 & Question 3:

The Trust has reviewed question 1 of your request for 

information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 

applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

Question 3: 

31/03/2024 N/A

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-

09/ANON%20Response%20-%20FOI%20DA4725.pdf

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-

09/ANON%20Response%20-%20FOI%20DA4725.pdf

IT Security

The Trust has reviewed question 1 of your request for 

information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000.

Section 31(1)(a) of the FOI Act states:

31(1) Information which is not exempt information by virtue 

of section 30 is exempt information if its disclosure under 

this Act would, or would be likely to, prejudice

(a) the prevention or detection of crime,

	

The information requested, if released into the public 

domain  would give professional hackers intelligence on 

the Trust's security platforms, increasing our potential risk. 

For this reason an exemption has been applied.

 N/A

Email and collaboration NHS.net N/A

Processing and computer capacity Manage Engine N/A

2. For each of the elements below, please provide details about your cloud provider: Main provider Contract end date Additional notes

Data storage

The Trust has reviewed question 1 of your request for 

information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 

applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

Question 1a

31/03/2027

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-

09/ANON%20Response%20-%20FOI%20DA4247.pdf

Networking VMWare 31/03/2027
Back-up and archive VMWare 31/03/2027
Application databases N/A N/A
Big Data analytics databases PowerBi 31/03/2024
Email and collaboration NHS.net N/A
Processing and computer capacity VMWare  31/03/2027

3: For each element detailed below, how does your organisation manage its data 

storage?
On premises Off premises Main supplier Annual spend 2022-2023

Contract end 

date

Additional 

notes

In-house data centre

DEFINITION: Physical or virtual servers that are connected internally and externally through 

networking and communication equipment to store, transfer and access digital information.

Shared service

The Trust has reviewed question 3 of your request for 

information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 

applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

Question 4

DEFINITION: The consolidation of business operations that are used by multiple parts of the 

same organization.
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-

09/ANON%20Response%20-%20FOI%20DA4247.pdf

Data Storage Management

DEFINITION: The management of various data storage methods used in the Trust

Other (please specify)

4: For each of the network supply systems listed below, please provide the requested 

details:
Main provider Annual spend 2022-2023 Contract end date Additional notes

Data network (broadband)

DEFINITION: Broadband is the actual internet connection afforded by your internet service 

provider (ISP), which you can access directly via a LAN or ethernet connection between your 

modem and device

WiFi (hardware)

DEFINITION: Wifi is a wireless connection between multiple devices and your router, and 

just one of the ways you can access the internet

CoIN (if applicable) - Community of Interest Network

WAN (Wide Area Network)

DEFINITION: WANs connect users and applications in geographically dispersed locations

Other (please specify)

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-10/FOI%20DA4820%20-%20Appendix%201.pdf

The Trust has reviewed question 3 of your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

Q3

N/A

N/A

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON%20Response%20-%20FOI%20DA4725.pdf

The Trust has reviewed question 3 of your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

Question 4

The Trust has reviewed question 3 of your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

Q3

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-10/FOI%20DA4820%20-%20Appendix%201.pdf

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-10/FOI%20DA4820%20-%20Appendix%201.pdf

The Trust has reviewed question 3 of your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

Q3

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON%20Response%20-%20FOI%20DA4725.pdf

The Trust has reviewed question 3 of your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

Question 4

The Trust has reviewed question 1 of your request for 

information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

states:

Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether 

it holds information of the description specified in the 

request, and 

(b) if that is the case, to have that information 

communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record a 

breakdown of spend as requested and is therefore unable 

to provide a response.	

The Trust has reviewed question 1 of your request for 

information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

states:

Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether 

it holds information of the description specified in the 

request, and 

(b) if that is the case, to have that information 

communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record a 

breakdown of spend as requested and is therefore unable 

to provide a response.	

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4247.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4247.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4247.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4247.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-10/FOI DA4820 - Appendix 1.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-10/FOI DA4820 - Appendix 1.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-10/FOI DA4820 - Appendix 1.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-10/FOI DA4820 - Appendix 1.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-10/FOI DA4820 - Appendix 1.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-10/FOI DA4820 - Appendix 1.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-10/FOI DA4820 - Appendix 1.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-10/FOI DA4820 - Appendix 1.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-10/FOI DA4820 - Appendix 1.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2023-09/ANON Response - FOI DA4725.pdf

