Organisation Name: ODS Code:

East London NHS Foundation Trust

Clarification: This would only be for your

Questions:	Acute Care	Mental Health	Community Care Services	Ambulance Trust	Primary Care	Other (Please Specify)
disalis.		mental reunit				Clarification: • Any other relevant NHS bodies refers to any that were missed out in the list provided (acute, mental health etc.) that your organisation may cover
1) Care Sectors Providers	No	Yes	Adult	No	Yes	
2) Main EPR Provider	The Trust has reviewed your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act (70) 2000.  Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— a public authority is entitled— (a) to be informed in writing the public (a) to be informed in writing the public actions of the description specified in the request, and	The Trust has reviewed your request for information under the Freedom of information at (FOR) 2000.  Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states: (1) Information at reasonably accessible to the applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt information.  The information requested is accessible here:	The Trust has reviewed your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states: (1) Information which is reasonably accessible to the applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt information.  The information requested is accessible here.	The Trust has reviewed your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act (FO) 2000. Section (1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 Section Missa request for Information to a public authority is entitled— (a) to be informed in matting by the public authority whether it holds information of the description (b) if that is the case, to have that information	EMIS	Not Applicable
	(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them.  East London NHS Foundation Trust is primarily a Mental Health and Community Health Trust and as such does not provide acute services. The Trust is therefore unable to provide a response.	Question 1:  bttps://www.ett.nhs.uk/sheeukletau8/fles/2024- 01/anon-response - foi da5131.pdf	Question 1:  https://www.elt.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024- Ol/anon response - fol da5131.pdf	Communicated to them.  East London NHS Foundation Trust is primarily a Mental Health and Community Health Trust and as such does not provide acute senders. The Trust is therefore unable to provide a response.		
3) Annual EPR Expenditure 2023/24		RIO - £887,968.00 EMIS - £307,007.00 IAMT - £307,007.00 SYSTM ONE - £135,933.00 Please note these EPR systems and its expenditure covers both Mental Health and Community Health Services	RIO - £887.986.00 EMIS - £307.007.00 IMPT - £541,118.00 SYSTM ONE - £135,933.00 Please note these EPR systems and its expenditure covers both Mental Health and Community Health Services		£307,007.00	Not Applicable
Breakdown by below:						
3a) Annual Support  Clarification: refers to funding pots and streams used to support the annual expenditure for your EPR.		The Trust has reviewed question 3a, 3b, 3c of your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000. Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:	The Trust has reviewed question 3a, 3b, 3c of your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000. Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:		The Trust has reviewed question 3a, 3b, 3c of your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000. Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:	Not Applicable
3b) Professional Services Clarification: refers to any extra services offered by your EPR provider to your organisation. 3c) New Feature / Modules Clarification: refers to any new features or modules included within your EPR system, outside of its core functionality, half provide		Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— (a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and (b) if that is the case, to have that shormation communicated to them. East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the information requested and is therefore unable to provide a response.	Any person making a request for information a public authority is entitled— (a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated by them, and the public and the pub		Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— (a) to be informed in writing by the public (a) to be informed in writing by the public of the description specified in the request, and (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them.  East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the information requested and is therefore unable to provide a response.	Not Applicable  Not Applicable
you with extra functionalities.						
4) Contract Renewal Date (Month/Year)		The Trust has reviewed your request for information under the Friedom of Information Act (FCP) 2000. Section 2(1) of the Friedom of Information Act (FCP) 2000. Section 2(1) of the Friedom of Information which is measurable to the applicant orderwise than under action 1 is exempt information. The information requested is accessible have:  Disastion 4:  Please note - the contract for Servidec has been exercised to January 2027.	The Total has reviewed your request for information what President of Information Act (FO) 2004 Act (FO)		The Trust has reviewed your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act (FO) 2000.  Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states: (I) Information which is reasonably accessible to the applicant observation than under action 1 is exempt information. The information requested is accessible here: Question 4: Please rote - the contract for Servetic has been extended to January 2027.	Not Applicable
		https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024- 01/anon_responsefoi_da5131.pdf	https://www.eft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024- 01/anon_responsefoi_da5131.pdf		https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sitesidefaul/files/2024- 01/anon_responsefoi_da5131.pdf	
5) Digital Maturity (Minimum Digital Foundations)		2.77	2.63		1.93 (not ELFT practices specifically NEL ICB wide as this is how primary care is measured)	Not Applicable
6) Please List Core Functionality Provided by Main EPR		Health information and data. Result management. Order management. Decision support. Electronic communication and connectivity. Administrative processes and reporting. Reporting and population health.	Health information and data. Result management. Order management. Decision support. Electronic communication and connectivity. Administrative processes and reporting. Reporting and population health.		Heath information and data. Result management. Order management. Decision support. Electronic communication and connectivity. Administrative processes and reporting. Reporting and population health.	Not Applicable