
System a. System type b. Supplier name c. System name d. Date installed e. Contract expiration f. Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No g. Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - 

Yes/No

h. Procurement framework i. Other systems it integrates with? j. Total value of contract k. Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender Is there an accompanying consulting 

support contract for this system? - Yes/No

If yes, please provide the consulting 

firm's name:

Consulting contract 

start date -

Consulting contract end 

date 

1 

Analytics (BI that includes 

outcomes): Analytical 

software and processes to 

collect and analyse data 

including clinical outcomes to 

support both business 

planning and reporting.

Microsoft Power BI Microsoft Microsoft Power BI 2020 31/05/2026 No The Trust has reviewed question 1g of your

request for information under the Freedom of

Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

	

Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether 

it holds information of the description specified in the 

request, and 

(b) if that is the case, to have that information 

communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the 

information requested and is therefore unable to provide a 

response.

Shared Business Service (SBS) Microsoft Power BI receives 

information from all the Trusts main 

clinical and non-clinical systems

£51,727.20 (annual cost) The Trust has reviewed question 1k of your

request for information under the Freedom of

Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

	

Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it 

holds information of the description specified in the request, 

and 

(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated 

to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust would not create a 

record for such information to be disclosed and is therefore 

unable to provide a response.

No N/A N/A N/A

2

BI & Data Warehousing: 

Integrates data and 

information collected from 

various sources, e.g. 

electronic patient/health 

records, enterprise resource 

planning systems, radiology 

and lab databases, 

wearables etc, into one 

comprehensive database

We have an intergrated data warehouse 

which was built and maintained in-house

N/A N/A 2023 31/03/2025 No The Trust has reviewed question 2g of your

request for information under the Freedom of

Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

	

Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether 

it holds information of the description specified in the 

request, and 

(b) if that is the case, to have that information 

communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the 

information requested and is therefore unable to provide a 

response.

Crown Commercial Service (CCS) The data warehouse receives 

information from all the Trusts main 

clinical and non-clinical systems

£318,128.32 (annual cost) Includes Storage, SQL Licenses and excludes Cloud 

support.

Yes BCN Group 01/04/2020 14/03/2025

3

Digital Dictation: device used 

for recording and managing 

natural speech, allowing staff 

to verbally input a patients' 

note into a system without 

having to manually input it.

The Trust has reviewed question 3a of 

your request for information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1) Information which is reasonably 

accessib le to the applicant otherwise than 

under section 1 is exempt information.

The information requested is accessible 

here: 

Question 2:

The Trust has reviewed question 3b of your 

request for information under the Freedom 

of Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1) Information which is reasonably 

accessib le to the applicant otherwise than 

under section 1 is exempt information.

The information requested is accessible 

here: 

Question 1:

The Trust has reviewed question 3c of your 

request for information under the Freedom 

of Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1) Information which is reasonably 

accessib le to the applicant otherwise than 

under section 1 is exempt information.

The information requested is accessible 

here: 

Question 1:

The Trust has reviewed question 3d of your 

request for information under the Freedom 

of Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1) Information which is reasonably 

accessib le to the applicant otherwise than 

under section 1 is exempt information.

The information requested is accessible 

here: 

Question 1d:

The Trust has reviewed question 3e of your 

request for information under the Freedom of 

Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1) Information which is reasonably 

accessib le to the applicant otherwise than 

under section 1 is exempt information.

The information requested is accessible 

here: 

Question 1e:

No The Trust has reviewed question 3g of your

request for information under the Freedom of

Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

	

Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether 

it holds information of the description specified in the 

request, and 

(b) if that is the case, to have that information 

communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the 

information requested and is therefore unable to provide a 

response.

The Trust has reviewed question 3h of your 

request for information under the Freedom 

of Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1) Information which is reasonably 

accessib le to the applicant otherwise than 

under section 1 is exempt information.

The information requested is accessible 

here: 

Question 1c:

N/A The Trust has reviewed question 3j 

of your request for information 

under the Freedom of Information 

Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:

(1) Information which is reasonably 

accessib le to the applicant 

otherwise than under section 1 is 

exempt information.

The information requested is 

accessible here: 

Question 1f:

The Trust has reviewed question 3k of your

request for information under the Freedom of

Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

	

Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it 

holds information of the description specified in the request, 

and 

(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated 

to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust would not create a 

record for such information to be disclosed and is therefore 

unable to provide a response.

No N/A N/A N/A

https ://www.el ft.nhs .uk/s i tes/default/fi le

s/2024-04/anon_response_2_-

_foi_da5250.pdf 

https ://www.el ft.nhs .uk/s i tes/default/fi les/

2024-04/anon_response_2_-_foi_da5250.pdf 

https ://www.el ft.nhs .uk/s i tes/default/fi les/

2024-04/anon_response_2_-_foi_da5250.pdf 

https ://www.el ft.nhs .uk/s i tes/default/fi les/

2024-10/anon_response_-_foi_da5569.pdf 

https ://www.el ft.nhs .uk/s i tes/default/fi les/2

024-10/anon_response_-_foi_da5569.pdf 

https ://www.el ft.nhs .uk/s i tes/default/fi les/

2024-10/anon_response_-_foi_da5569.pdf 

https ://www.el ft.nhs .uk/s i tes/defa

ult/fi les/2024-10/anon_response_-

_foi_da5569.pdf 

4 - Improving Access to 

Psychological Therapies 

(IAPT): A patient management 

and reporting system for 

psychological therapists 

providing cognitive 

behavioural therapy (CBT) 

and other related treatments, 

which meets the central IAPT 

reporting requirements. Used 

to measure local 

accessibility of psychological 

therapies.

IAPTUS Mayden IAPTUS Not installed - web-based service hosted by 

Mayden

31/10/2026 No The Trust has reviewed question 3g of your

request for information under the Freedom of

Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

	

Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether 

it holds information of the description specified in the 

request, and 

(b) if that is the case, to have that information 

communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the 

information requested and is therefore unable to provide a 

response.

Gcloud NHS Spine £293,243.00 The Trust has reviewed question 4k of your

request for information under the Freedom of

Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

	

Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it 

holds information of the description specified in the request, 

and 

(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated 

to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust would not create a 

record for such information to be disclosed and is therefore 

unable to provide a response.

No N/A N/A N/A

5  - Secondary Care EPS: 

Advanced e-prescribing in 

use across wards for 

outpatient care, incorporating 

specialist prescribing and 

(ideally) clinical decision 

support, integrated as part of 

end-to-end medicines 

management. This possibly 

offers the single biggest 

opportunity for improving 

patient safety through 

digitalisation.

 Electronic Prescription Service  CLEO Systems  CLEO SOLO EPS  24/07/2023 31/03/2025 Yes The Trust has reviewed question 5g of your

request for information under the Freedom of

Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

	

Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether 

it holds information of the description specified in the 

request, and 

(b) if that is the case, to have that information 

communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the 

information requested and is therefore unable to provide a 

response.

Waiver None £47,640.00 The Trust has reviewed question 5k of your

request for information under the Freedom of

Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

	

Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it 

holds information of the description specified in the request, 

and 

(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated 

to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust would not create a 

record for such information to be disclosed and is therefore 

unable to provide a response.

No N/A N/A N/A

6: Voice recognition: 

Identifies and translates 

spoken words into text. 

Used to complete tasks or 

transcribe documents.

Digital Dictation and Transcription 

systems

Bighand and Nuance Bighand and Dragon Medical One 03/01/2023 31/05/2027 No The Trust has reviewed question 5g of your

request for information under the Freedom of

Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

	

Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether 

it holds information of the description specified in the 

request, and 

(b) if that is the case, to have that information 

communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the 

information requested and is therefore unable to provide a 

response.

SBS Dragon can be used within RIO 

dictations

£306,600.00 The Trust has reviewed question 6k of your

request for information under the Freedom of

Information Act (FOI) 2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

	

Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it 

holds information of the description specified in the request, 

and 

(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated 

to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust would not create a 

record for such information to be disclosed and is therefore 

unable to provide a response.

No N/A N/A N/A

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-04/anon_response_2_-_foi_da5250.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-04/anon_response_2_-_foi_da5250.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-04/anon_response_2_-_foi_da5250.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-04/anon_response_2_-_foi_da5250.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-04/anon_response_2_-_foi_da5250.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-04/anon_response_2_-_foi_da5250.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-04/anon_response_2_-_foi_da5250.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-10/anon_response_-_foi_da5569.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-10/anon_response_-_foi_da5569.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-10/anon_response_-_foi_da5569.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-10/anon_response_-_foi_da5569.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-10/anon_response_-_foi_da5569.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-10/anon_response_-_foi_da5569.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-10/anon_response_-_foi_da5569.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-10/anon_response_-_foi_da5569.pdf
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2024-10/anon_response_-_foi_da5569.pdf

